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“Colleen is an expert active 

listener and consistently reflected 

my words and ideas back at me 

so that I could learn how to 

support my own growth and 

nurture my own ideas. I was 

always in the driver's seat with 

my development, but Colleen's 

wisdom provided me with a great 

roadmap to success. Colleen's 

biggest strength was her ability to 

know when to push me 

professionally. Her direct, 

thoughtful, and empathic words 

of wisdom gave me the ability to 

make the next move. .” 

- Aaron Jorgensen         

Senior Director of Network 

Student Affairs 

Northeastern University 

 

Contact Colleen: 

 

Colleen Moriarty Ryan 
 

Colleen Ryan is a coach, facilitator and trainer who works with 
individuals and teams to help them better understand themselves 
so they can improve their work. As a coach, she brings her 
compassionate candor to help clients gain clarity on what matters 
most. She enjoys working with leaders who are looking to 
rehumanize the workplace and improve the positive impact of their 
leadership.  As a trainer and facilitator, Colleen brings energy and 
engagement while helping people transform complex topics into 
actionable next steps.  
 
Colleen is a conflict resolution practitioner who has ten years of 
experience working in higher education administration, overseeing 
student conduct and sexual harassment policies and resolution 
processes. Additionally, she has ten years of experience in 
marketing and client services for technology companies. 
Throughout her career, Colleen found purpose and enjoyment 
facilitating difficult conversations that encourage self-reflection and 
identity development.  She has trained professionals to leverage 
conflict resolutions skills to help develop the strength and capability 
of others.  
 
Colleen was trained in mediation in 2007 and restorative justice in 
2013. She is a certified facilitator of the Myers-Briggs Type Indicator 
(MBTI) and she is in the process of completing her Leadership 
Coaching certificate at Georgetown University. She holds a B.A. in 
Psychology from Boston College and a M.Ed. in Higher Education 
Administration from Loyola University Chicago. 
 
Colleen lives west of Boston with her husband and two children. 
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